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Day 1

DAY 01 II ARRIVAL DELHI II FLIGHT

Upon arrival at Delhi airport you will be met with our representative who is anxiously waiting for you in
arrival hall to welcome you. After Traditional Welcome you will be transferred to your hotel. Overnight at
hotel.

Day 2

DAY 02 II DELHI

Discover Delhi's essence in a full-day tour featuring the majestic Red Fort (exterior view), the grandeur of
Jama Masjid, and the serenity of Rajghat, paying homage to Mahatma Gandhi. Admire the architectural
brilliance of India Gate, the President's House, and the spiritual oasis of Gurudwara Bangla Sahib. Explore
the historical treasures of Humayun's Tomb and the towering Qutub Minar. Overnight at hotel.

Day 3

DAY 03 II DELHI – VARANASI II FLIGHT

After breakfast transfer to airport to board flight to Varanasi. Upon arrival transfer to the hotel. Proceed for
boat ride to evening Aarti (17:30), as the sun begins to set, embark on a serene boat ride along the Ganges
River to witness the enchanting Evening Aarti ceremony. Overnight at hotel.

Day 4

DAY 04 II VARANASI

Embark on a mesmerizing boat ride along the sacred Ganges, where the gentle ripples tell tales of ancient
spirituality. After breakfast explore the enchanting Golden Temple, Banaras Hindu University, Tulsi Manas
Temple, concluding with a lassi indulgence at the Blue Lassi Shop. Overnight at hotel.

Day 5

DAY 05 II VARANASI – AYODHYA II 220 KMS /4.5 HRS

After breakfast drive to Ayodhya. Upon arrival check in at Hotel. Later start your trip by visiting the Ram
Janmabhoomi, the birthplace of Lord Rama. Explore the sacred site and learn about its historical and cultural
significance. Visit the Saryu Ghats and take a boat ride on the holy river. Enjoy the serene surroundings and
capture some memorable moments. Attend the evening Aarti at one of the Ghats along the Sarayu River. The



Aarti is a mesmerizing experience, and you can soak in the spiritual atmosphere. Overnight at hotel.

Day 6

DAY 06 II AYODHYA – LUCKNOW II 140 KMS /3 HRS

After breakfast drive to Lucknow. Upon arrival check in at hotel. Embark on a Heritage Walk through the
historic Qaiser Bagh area. Rest of the time free at leisure. Overnight at hotel. 

Day 7

DAY 07 II LUCKNOW

After breakfast explore the architectural wonders of Bara Imambara, a grand edifice boasting the colossal
central hall and the intriguing labyrinth of Bhool Bhulaiya, reflecting the opulence of Nawab Asaf-ud-Daula's
era. Visit the Chota Imambara, a smaller replica adorned with intricate decorations and a stunning golden
dome, showcasing the city's artistic finesse. Behold the imposing Rumi Darwaza, an iconic gateway standing
as a testament to Lucknow's architectural grandeur. These landmarks, steeped in history and cultural
significance, offer a glimpse into the rich heritage of Lucknow, making it a captivating destination for history
enthusiasts and travelers alike. Indulge in a flavorful lunch at a renowned Kebab Restaurant. Rest of the time
free at leisure. Overnight at hotel.

Day 8

DAY 08 II LUCKNOW – CHAMBAL II 288 KMS /4 HRS

After breakfast drive to Chambal. Upon arrival check in at hotel. Later proceed with the River Safari, is
designed to provide spectacular sightings of the gharials, muggers & turtles basking in the sun; the many
migratory and resident birds flying sorties; the occasional glimpses of the Gangetic river dolphins breaking
surface. Overnight at hotel. 

Day 9

DAY 09 II CHAMBAL – AGRA II 86 KMS /1.5 HRS

Breakfast at hotel. Later proceed with the Blackbuck jeep safari heads southwest towards the countryside
between the Chambal and Yamuna ravines, for excellent sightings of Blackbuck deer and numerous dry land
birds including the Indian Courser. It is also a fascinating journey through remote hamlets and habitations; a
world that is strangely as connected as it appears removed from modern India. After Safari return hotel for
checkout and drive to Agra. Upon arrival check into hotel. Later, enjoy the sunset view of the Taj Mahal.
Overnight at hotel.

Day 10

DAY 10 II AGRA



Witness the enchanting sunrise at the Taj Mahal, followed by a relaxing breakfast at the hotel. Explore the
majestic Agra Fort, visit the Inlay Marble Factory, enjoy lunch at Pinch of Spice, and stroll through the
picturesque Mehtab Bagh. Overnight at hotel.

Day 11

DAY 11 II AGRA – MORADABAD II 330 KMS / 5.5 HRS

After breakfast, embark on a scenic drive to Moradabad. Nestled along the banks of the Ramganga River,
Moradabad is renowned for its rich cultural heritage and vibrant handicrafts, especially brassware. Take the
afternoon to explore the city at your own pace, immersing yourself in its bustling markets and artistic
delights. Overnight at hotel.

Day 12

DAY 12 II MORADABAD – CORBETT NATIONAL PARK II 90 KMS / 2.5 HRS

After breakfast, journey to Corbett National Park. Upon arrival, embrace the serenity of the surroundings.
Check into hotel and indulge in a delightful dinner, experiencing the flavors of the region. Unwind in the
heart of nature with an overnight stay, promising a blissful retreat in this wildlife haven. Overnight at hotel.

Day 13

DAY 13 II CORBETT NATIONAL PARK

In the morning, embark on an exhilarating jeep safari. Later relax, swim, and enjoy the surroundings.
Experience a jungle walk and conclude the day with dinner and an overnight stay at hotel.

Day 14

DAY 14 II CORBETT NATIONAL PARK – RISHIKESH II 175 KMS / 4.5 HRS

After breakfast, check out and set forth on a scenic journey to Rishikesh, making a captivating stop at
Bhakrakot village en route. Upon arrival check into hotel; later delight in a special experience with a visit to
Bhakrakot Village. Overnight at hotel.

Day 15

DAY 15 II RISHIKESH

Begin your day with a serene dip in the Ganges, followed by refreshing yoga session. Rest of the time free at
leisure. Overnight at hotel.

Day 16



DAY 16 II RISHIKESH

Start your day with some yoga, followed by a delicious breakfast. Take a nice walk around Rishikesh in the
morning, and for lunch, you can try some local food in Rishikesh on your own. Make your day extra special
by visiting an Ashram and having a chat with a Palmist during or after your walk. Enjoy the calm atmosphere
and unique experiences at this riverside spot. Overnight at hotel.

Day 17

DAY 17 II RISHIKESH – DELHI II 230 KMS / 5.5 HRS

After breakfast check out and drive to Delhi and check into hotel. Overnight at hotel.

Day 18

DAY 18 II DELHI – DEPARTURE II FLIGHT

After breakfast transfer to International airport to connect flight to onward destination.


